
BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Kevitt Excavating. LLC

Ramsey Excavating 

Company, Inc.

Century Construction 

Company

Kellington 

Construction, Inc.

George F Cook 

Construction Co.

Lloyd's Construction 

Services, Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 0 7 7 7

BASE BID $152,145.00 $180,000.00 $193,800.00 $205,000.00 $257,800.00 $297,605.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid $18,700.00 $19,900.00 $18,400.00 $2,600.00 $17,225.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid $11,800.00 $2,650.00 $2,000.00 $6,000.00 $1,900.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

No Bid $2,500.00 $11,750.00 $20,600.00 $16,800.00 $18,700.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 02-A  for Demolition



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 03-A for Concrete

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

B & D Associates, LLC

Maertens-Brenny 

Construction Company Hollenback & Nelson, Inc. Axel H. Ohman, Inc.

BID SECURITY No Yes yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $372,700.00 $379,000.00 $416,800.00 $457,700.00

COMBINED BASE BID 3A & 4A Deduct ($10,000) 3A & 4A Deduct ($30,000)

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $15,100.00 $14,000.00 $15,900.00 $23,445.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $5,340.00 $16,000.00 $12,100.00 $12,000.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$9,900.00 $22,000.00 $18,900.00 $11,500.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

B & D Associates, LLC Axel H. Ohman, Inc.

Patzoldt Concrete & 

Masonry LLC

Maertens-Brenny 

Construction Company Hollenback & Nelson, Inc.

American Masonry 

Restoration Corp

BID SECURITY Not Required Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7 6

BASE BID $97,200.00 $148,700.00 $149,000.00 $165,000.00 $280,000.00 $365,500.00

COMBINED BASE BID 3A & 4A Deduct ($10,000) 3A & 4A Deduct ($30,000)

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $39,800.00 $35,000.00 $25,000.00 $23,000.00 $71,500.00 $18,250.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid $14,000.00 No Bid $800.00 $22,800.00 $1,500.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$7,080.00 No Bid No Bid $9,000.00 $0.00 No Change

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 04-A for Masonry



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Briese Iron Works Inc.

Thurnback Steel 

Fabrication, Inc. Daka Corporation Bergh's Fabricating, Inc.

Brown hawk LLC dba 

Northern Lights Steel 

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $158,900.00 $164,546.00 $178,400.00 $178,900.00 $190,300.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $2,550.00 $2,916.00 $3,700.00 $3,700.00 $3,550.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A No Bid $500.00 $800.00 N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$10,700.00 $15,989.00 $11,500.00 $11,000.00 $11,510.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 05-A for Structural Steel - Material Only



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

KMH Erectors, Inc.

High Five Erectors II, 

Inc.

Northern Industrial 

Eretors, Inc.

Red Cedar Steel 

Erectors Amerect Inc. Sowles Co.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Not Required Yes Not Required Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $118,400.00 $136,415.00 $146,000.00 $146,950.00 $149,000.00 $153,000.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $2,650.00 $3,200.00 $8,520.00 $4,600.00 $5,900.00 $12,500.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $2,600.00 N/A $0.00 N/A No Bid N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

N/A $2,900.00 $0.00 N/A No Bid $3,500.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 05-B for Structural Steel - Erection



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 06-A for Carpentry
                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Schreiber Mullaney 

Construction Company, 

Inc.

Meisinger Construction 

Company, Inc.

Parkos Construction 

Company

Kellington 

Construction, Inc.

Tekton Construction 

Company

George F Cook 

Construction Co.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 6 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $417,580.00 $449,000.00 $454,000.00 $455,000.00 $468,000.00 $476,800.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD 

area - (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $12,900.00 $11,800.00 $10,000.00 $6,600.00 $7,500.00 $9,300.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD 

area - (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $2,257.00 $2,100.00 $2,100.00 $1,720.00 $1,708.00 $2,000.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD 

area - (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$22,765.00 $11,800.00 $18,000.00 $18,670.00 $17,964.00 $10,300.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Construction Results 

Corporation

Reiling Construction 

Co., Inc

Senoma, Inc. dba 

Century Construction 

Company

Meartens Brenny 

Construction Company

CM Construction 

Company, Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 0 7 7

BASE BID $495,500.00 $499,850.00 $507,725.00 $540,000.00 $638,000.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD 

area - (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $13,990.00 $4,900.00 $6,175.00 $12,000.00 $13,000.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD 

area - (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $26,575.00 $21,908.00 $2,300.00 $18,000.00 $8,800.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD 

area - (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$2,250.00 $18,600.00 $21,725.00 $7,000.00 $20,000.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 06-A for Carpentry (CONT)



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Division V Sheet Metal 

Inc.

Central Roofing 

Company

Progressive Bldg 

Systems, Ltd Flynn Midwest

Berwald Roofing 

Company, Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes No Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $139,907.00 $169,900.00 $189,000.00 $228,761.00 No Bid

COMBINED BASE BID $375,496.00

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 07-F for Metal Panels



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

BL Dalsin Roofing

Central Roofing 

Company

Palmer West 

Construction Company, 

Inc. Flynn Midwest

Berwald Roofing 

Company, Inc.

BID SECURITY Not Required Yes Yes No Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $162,621.00 $188,405.00 $193,800.00 $225,350.00 No Bid

COMBINED BASE BID $375,496.00

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $2,147.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A N/A N/A N/A N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$5,010.00 N/A N/A N/A N/A

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 07-H for Roofing



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Carciofini Company

BID SECURITY Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. Yes

BASE BID $77,900.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

N/A

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 07-K for Joint Sealant



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA NO BIDS
                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

No Bids

BID SECURITY

ADDENDA REC'D.

BASE BID

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 08-D for Special Doors



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Envision Glass Inc.

Advanced Arch Glazing, 

LLC Empirehouse, Inc.

Northern Glass & 

Glazing, Inc. S and J Glass, Inc.

Brin Glass Company 

DBA Brin Contract 

Glazing

BID SECURITY Not Required Not Required Not Required Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 6 7 7 0 0 7

BASE BID $166,300.00 $166,900.00 $170,315.00 $185,000.00 $188,000.00 $197,600.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $5,900.00 $5,920.00 $4,150.00 $5,000.00 $6,175.00 $2,025.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A $0.00 N/A No Bid $679.00 $550.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$680.00 $950.00 $505.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 08-F for Entrances, Storefront, & Curtain Wall



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Egan Company

BID SECURITY Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 6

BASE BID $333,850.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $11,500.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $0.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$3,000.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 08-F for Entrances, Storefront, & Curtain Wall (CONT)



SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 09-A for Drywall
                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

RTL Construction, Inc.

Pinnicle Wall Systems, 

Inc. Custom Drywall Inc

Olympic Companies, 

Inc.

Commercial Drywall, 

Inc. Mulcahy Nickolaus LLC

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $426,369.00 $519,800.00 $523,500.00 $527,960.00 $529,695.00 $544,900.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $1,900.00 $5,400.00 $7,800.00 $4,380.00 No Bid $1,200.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $10,000.00 $7,000.00 $5,900.00 $23,964.00 $9,750.00 $5,970.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$16,000.00 $29,800.00 $21,800.00 $6,200.00 $16,940.00 $17,500.00



SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 09-A for Drywall Cont.
                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
SA Jordan Construction, 

Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7

BASE BID $649,600.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $3,644.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $6,783.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$30,400.00



SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 09-B for Tile
                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Blackhawk Tile and 

Stone, Inc.

Grazzini Brothers and 

Company CD Tile and Stsone WTG Terrazzo and Tile PHB Construction

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Not Required Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 6 7 7 7

BASE BID $87,031.00 $87,425.00 $90,000.00 $107,300.00 Non-Responsive Bid

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid $7,545.00 No Bid $0.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $8,975.00 No Bid $6,700.00 $11,400.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.00



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Twin City Acoustics, Inc. Sonus Interiors Inc.

Architectural Sales of 

MN

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7

BASE BID $74,210.00 $81,800.00 $95,918.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid No Bid N/A

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $5,160.00 $5,200.00 $6,148.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

No Bid No Bid N/A

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 09-C for Ceilings and Acoustical Treatment



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Rickway Inc.

COMMERCIAL 

FLOORING SERVICES, Acoustics Associates

Grazzini Brothers and 

Company 

BID SECURITY Not Required Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 6 7 7

BASE BID $167,000.00 $167,495.00 $336,128.00 $413,500.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $10,000.00 $8,060.00 No Bid $16,605.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $800.00 $800.00 No Bid $460.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$1,500.00 $220.00 No Bid $945.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 09-D for Flooring



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Superior Painting & 

Decorating, Inc.

Steinbrecher Painting 

Company

Wasche Commerical 

Finishes

Hamernick Interior 

Solutions

Fransen Decorating, 

Inc. The Berg Group

BID SECURITY Not Required Yes Yes Not Required Not Required

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 0 7 0 7

BASE BID $73,600.00 $86,625.00 $103,500.00 $115,850.00 $124,166.00 Non-Responsive Bid

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD 

area - (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $3,657.00 $2,590.00 $3,325.00 $3,340.00 $4,655.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD 

area - (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $2,528.00 $3,785.00 $4,350.00 $4,540.00 $5,330.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD 

area - (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$2,000.00 $2,530.00 $1,475.00 $1,680.00 $2,800.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 09-K for Painting and Wall Covering



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Skold Specialty 

Contracting LLC

BID SECURITY Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7

BASE BID $28,270.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $0.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $0.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$0.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 10-E for Movable Partitions



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 21-A for Fire Suppression
                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Breth-Zenzen Fire 

Protection, LLC

Summit Fire Protection 

Co. dba Summit 

Companies

Viking Automatic 

Sprinkler Co.

Nasseff Mechancial 

Contractors, Inc.

BID SECURITY Not Required Not Required Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 0 7

BASE BID $109,600.00 $169,900.00 $265,000.00 $451,500.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $3,200.00 N/A $3,000.00 N/A

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $3,100.00 N/A $2,600.00 $7,500.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$2,100.00 $5,300.00 $3,300.00 N/A

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA Work Scope 23-A for Combined Mechanical

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

RJ Mechanical, Inc.

Northern Air 

Corporation dba NAC 

Mechanical & Electrical 

Services Metro Sheet Metal, Inc. Pioneer Power Inc.

United States 

Mechanical Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 0 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $1,729,000.00 $1,756,600.00 $1,823,000.00 $1,880,000.00 $1,895,000.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $59,000.00 $67,300.00 $91,500.00 $68,000.00 $60,000.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $77,500.00 N/A $86,500.00 $59,000.00 $80,000.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$10,800.00 $97,200.00 N/A N/A No Bid

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility



SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Harris St Paul, Inc. Klamm Mechanical

Kraft Mechancial,LLC 

dba Kraft Mechanical, 

LLC

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 6 7 7

BASE BID $2,017,451.00 $2,059,200.00 $2,149,300.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $62,461.00 $67,500.00 $68,600.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $98,170.00 $96,300.00 $101,250.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

N/A $11,250.00 $0.00

Work Scope 23-A for Combined Mechanical (CONT)



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Muska Electric Co. Egan Company Master Electric Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7

BASE BID $2,274,000.00 $2,321,000.00 $3,265,250.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $40,350.00 $50,800.00 $42,700.00

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $6,000.00 $7,500.00 $6,220.00

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$34,400.00 $28,400.00 $12,450.00

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 26-A for Electrical



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

US SiteWork, Inc. Kevitt Companies Rachel Contracting, LLC

Carl Bolander and Sons, 

LLC Urban Companies Veit & Company Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $608,333.00 $701,784.00 $780,400.00 $1,066,530.00 $1,100,000.00 $1,181,115.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $0.00 Deduct ($18,500) Deduct ($10,000) Deduct ($24,500) Deduct ($20,000) No Bid

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. $0.00 No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

$0.00 No Bid N/A N/A No Bid No Bid

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 31-A for Site Clearing and Earthwork



SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER
Park Construction 

Company

Frattalone Companies 

Inc.

BID SECURITY Yes Yes

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7

BASE BID $1,134,020.00 $1,147,000.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. Add $12,952 Deduct ($36,750) 

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. N/A N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

N/A N/A

Work Scope 31-A for Site Clearing and Earthwork (CONT)



BID TABULATIONS
April 2nd at 2:00PM

OWNER:  St. Paul Public Schools

ARCHITECT: TKDA

                     

BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER BIDDER

Northland Paving, LLC

Bituminous Roadways 

Inc.

Park Construction 

Company TA Schifsky & Sons, Inc.

BID SECURITY Not Required Not Required Not Required Not Required

ADDENDA REC'D. 7 7 7 7

BASE BID $113,000.00 $124,825.00 $126,090.00 $141,500.00

COMBINED BASE BID

Alternate No. 1: ADD area 

- (Area C).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid No Bid N/A N/A

Alternate No. 2: ADD area 

- (Area H).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. No Bid No Bid N/A N/A

Alternate No. 3: ADD area 

- (Area D).  Refer to 

drawings for extent of 

work 

included in this alternate. 

No Bid No Bid N/A N/A

SPPS 1930 Como District Service Facility

Work Scope 32-A for Asphalt Paving


